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Curly-CoatedRetnevers
Obedlence—Another Plus
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one’s past hard work will be well worth
it.The success at different obedience
levels will become so importantwhen
challenging situations arise. Each year,
your dog will be more delightful to live
with, and all of your past patience in
the ringwill manifest itselfwhen one
needs it.
Also, since Curlies can become bored

with repetition, I have decided to occa—

sionally take a break from the higher
levels of training and try one of the
optional titling events that some obedi—

ence clubs offer. Beginner’s Novice is

especially tempting, as that combines a
little of rally with basic obedience.

I have just received word that the
Curly—CoatedRetrieverClub of
America will be holding the club’s first
Hunting RetrieverTest in Ohio this
month.Anyonewho wishes to see a
number ofCurlies performing in the
field should attend this event. For more
information, please contact me.—Am1
Shin/clef; Annshinkle@aol.com

Flat-Coated
Retrievers
Anxiety Wraps and Calming
Caps
The Flat—Coated Retriever can be

an excitable breed that can easily
develop separation and other anxieties.
I’ve written before about training
techniques that calm the Flat—Coat and
relieve anxiety,but since those articles
we have also learned to use anxiety
wraps and calming caps.
The snugness of an anxiety wrap is

comforting to the dog and has a calm—

ing effect as long as the dog is under
the control of the owner, like swaddling
a babyAn anxiety wrap can either be a

wrap or towel pinnedwith horse—blan—

ket pins tightly around the dog’s chest
and body, or a professionally made item.
The Flat—Coat is taught to wear it dur—
ing on—lead training at first,when he or
she can easily be trained to leave it
alone.As the dog becomes familiar with
the wrap, the leash can be gradually
eliminated. but leaving a wrapped Flat—

Coat unsupervised can lead to unwrap—
ping and eating of the material by a
Flat—Coat, who might swallow a band—

age or a toyWe have noticed that some
dogs are calmed simply by wearing a

very wide plastic collar fitted snugly
The wrap can be used whenever the

dog needs a calming effect, such as

when riding in the car, socializing, or
becoming anxious about thunder—
storms. As the dog’s behavior improves
through the calming training and wrap,
the wrap itself can gradually be phased
out.Thismight take a long time, due to
the Flat—Coat’s prolonged adolescent
period.

Storm—shyness can become worse
with age, however, and a variety of
techniques should be employed. Ifyour
dog is at all sensitive to noise, be noisy
and gradually noisier when you feed or
play with him. Use tapes or CDs of
storms, trains, fireworks, and other
sounds—softly at first, and gradually
louder during play, work, and feeding,
to gradually condition your dog to
expect positive things to happen with
increasing noise.
We have cured gun—shyness,which

was previously thought to be incurable,
so patience and persistence pays off.
Ifyour dog is becoming storm—shy,

talk to your vet or behaviorist about
possible medication as well. Storm— or
noise—shyness can be caused by disci—

plining with noise (such as with news—

papers and shaker cans) or by leaving
dogs outdoors unsupervised and
exposed to noise that is threatening (in
the dog’s opinion) or severe storms.
Calming caps are made of cloth that

your dog can see through, fitted over
your dog’s eyes, causing him to be less
distressed and stimulated about nearby
activities. It can be compared to blind—

ers on a horse.You can purchase these
or make them yourself. If a dog is over—
stimulated by squirrels or rabbits while
on a walk (on leash) or by the other
dogs at training class, a calming cap can
be used temporarily until your training
of your dog takes over and he learns to
be controllable under those circum—
stances.
We prefer to train dogs to totally

ignore small animals, which are nothing
but a frustration to the dog anyway. The
calming cap can also be used when
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your dog is overstimulated looking out
ofwindows in the car, until you can
teach him to ride quietly and safely in
one place.—Sally]. Terroux;
sjterroux@aol.com

Golden Retrievers
Front Angulation on the Dog

he desired construction of the
forequarters is one of the most

misunderstood and controversial areas
of canine anatomy.
Breeders and judges often mention
problems with a lack of balance and
angulation in the forequarters, yet
sometimes it seems that the definition
of a “correct” front is a mystery to most
exhibitors and breeders.
Rachel Page Elliott, author of

Dogsteps, was one of a number of peo—
ple who involved themselves in exten—
sive research into just what it is that
allows a dog to move correctly or
incorrectly.
Her research led her to conclude,

based on the study ofX—rays of dogs in
motion as well as standard X—rays, that
the most desirable front angulation was
not 45 degrees, as is commonly taught,
but between about 30 to 35 degrees.
This is a considerably more open angle
than the right angle we’d been taught
to expect.
Some experts disagree with these

findings. I’ve often wondered why the
difference.

I offer for your consideration three
points that give possible answers to this
puzzling question. First, there is a dif—

ference between whatwe see on the
exterior of the dog and the actual
skeletal structure beneath the flesh and
muscle.The angles of the shoulder
blade and upper arm are not always
easily seen or felt on the body of a dog,
especially on a coated breed like our
Goldens. Often we are required to
make an approximation. Making precise
measurement points on the outside
body of a dog so they are consistent
on every dog measured would be very
difficult.
Second, much depends on exactly

where you do the measuring. Not
everyone can accurately pinpoint the


